
RESOLUTION 

OF THE GOVERNMENT OF THE CZECH REPUBLIC 
dated March 23, 2020, No. 293 

 
on amendment of the Resolution No. dated March 19, 2020, No. 257 on Target program 

to support employment 
 
The Government  
 
amends the Government Resolution dated March 19, 2020, No. 257, on Target Program to 
support employment as follows: 
 
1. point I. now reads “approves”, 

 
2. inserts new point I/1 with wording: ”Target program to support employment (hereinafter 

referred to as “Target program”), the estimated costs of its implementation and its 
execution schedule”, as amended by proposed amendment of the submitter on March 
23, 2020, 

 
3. inserts new point I/2 with wording: “Target Program to support employment – part II., 

estimate of monthly costs on its implementation and its execution schedule”, contained 
in the document file No. 254/20. 

 
4. point II/2 newly reads: “Minister of Labor and Social Affairs to ensure the implementation 

of regime B (payment of contribution for the wages or salary compensation pursuant to 
Section 208 LC due to the impossibility of allocating work in connection with the 
issuance of emergency resolutions by the Government of CR and extraordinary 
measures of the Ministry of Health for protection of public health in connection with the 
spread of the COVID-19 disease, especially the extraordinary measure issued by the 
Ministry of Health dated March 10, 2020, file No. MZDR 10666/2020-1/MIN/KAN, 
Government Resolution dated March 12, 2020 No. 199, Government Resolution dated 
March 12, 2020 No. 201, Government Resolution dated March 13, 2020 No. 208, 
Government Resolution dated March 14, 2020 No. 211, Government Resolution dated 
March 15, 2020 No. 215, and those directly following) specified in part II.6.2 of Target 
program, through the Labor Office of the Czech Republic, 

 
5. point II/3 newly reads: “Minister of Labor and Social Affairs to ensure the implementation 

of regime C (payment of contribution of the wages or salary compensation due to 
impossibility of allocating work due to imposed quarantine or on connection with 
occurrence of significant obstacle on the side of the employee under Section 191 of the 
Act No. 262/2006 Coll., the Labor Code, as amended (hereinafter referred to as “LC”) 
caused by the care for a child younger than 10 years in connection with issuance of the 
Government Regulation dated March 13, 2020 No. 201 and following within 30% of 
employers employees) specified in part II.6.1 of the Target program to support 
employment - part II. through the Labor Office of the Czech Republic, 

 
6. inserts new point II/4 with wording: “Minister of Labor and Social Affairs to ensure the 

implementation of regime D (payment of the contribution for the wages or salary 
compensation due to occurrence of obstacle on the side of employer pursuant to Section 
207 letter a) LC due to restriction of availability of inputs necessary for activities of the 
employer due to quarantine measures (or generally outage of production in causal nexus 
with COVID-19 infection) of their supplier, including abroad), specified in part II.6.2 of the 
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Target program to support employment - part II. through the Labor Office of the Czech 
Republic, 

 
7. inserts new point II/5 in the wording: “Minister of Labor and Social Affairs to ensure the 

implementation of regime E (payment of the contribution for wages or salary 
compensation due to occurrence of obstacle to work on side of the employer pursuant to 
Section 209 LC due to restriction of demand for services, goods and other products of 
employer as a result of quarantine measures in place of the market or in other ways in 
causal nexus with COVID-19 infection) specified in part II.6.3 of the Target program to 
support employment – part II. through the Labor Office of the Czech Republic, 

 
8. inserts new point II/6 in the wording: “Minister of Labor and Social Affairs to submit to the 

Government of CR for approval a request for excluding means for first allocation of both 
parts of the Target program to support employment specified in points I.1 and I.2 for 
March 2020.”, 

 
9. inserts new point II/7 in the wording: “Minister of Labor and Social Affairs to execute 

mutual methodic of both parts of the Target program to support employment specified in 
points I.1 and I.2 and submit it to the approval of the Government of CR”, 

 
10. in part To be implemented by: the words “Deputy Prime Minister and Minister of 

Finance” are removed.  
 
 
 
 
Ing. Andrej Babiš, m. p. 
Prime minister 
 
 


